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Are you sure that during law school you 
have developed all the skills you need to 
become a successful lawyer? 
 

What about, for example, how you are going to behave in the office 
and what rules of etiquette you should follow when dealing with 
partners, associates, trainees and clients? 
 
Every senior lawyer will tell you that the ability to deal with people 
effectively and politely (also known as “soft skills”) is just as 
important as, if not more important than, technical skills. 
 
Written by a practicing City lawyer, Soft Skills for Lawyers contains 
practical suggestions for lawyers on how to deal with people in every 
different work situation and covers topics such as verbal and 
nonverbal communication, body language, business etiquette, 
marketing, public speaking and time and stress management. 
 
For more junior lawyers, it also contains a section on how to become 
a partner in your firm, which includes practical suggestions on 
specialisation, how to relate to partners, how to raise your profile and 
develop a more resilient, confident and business-focused attitude 
from the start! 

 

Know what to do and what to say in every 
work situation and make sure you come 
across always in the best possible way! 
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CHAPTER 1 – INTRODUCTION TO SOFT SKILLS 

 
1. Definition of Soft Skills 
  
There has been a lot of talking recently in the legal profession about 
soft skills. A number of articles emphasising the importance of soft 
skills for lawyers have appeared in the legal press; a number of large 
City firms have introduced courses and programmes to offer their 
lawyers and partners basic training in soft skills; and a number of 
consulting and coaching organisations have started to market their 
services in this area to individual lawyers and law firms.  
 
But what are soft skills and why are they important to the legal 
profession? 
 
Soft skills are generally defined as those skills that influence how we 
interact with people. They include, at the most basic level, such 
abilities as effective communication, leadership, team building and 
listening skills and, at a more sophisticated level, such abilities as 
career planning, marketing and sales pitches, project management 
and delegation, public speaking and time management.  
 
Soft skills are generally contrasted to technical skills or “hard skills”, 
a category that includes, so far as lawyers are concerned, skills such 
as knowledge of the law and legal practice, legal analysis, legal 
research, legal drafting, business knowledge and so on.  
 
The corporate world, particularly in the United States, has been 
reaping the benefits of training in soft skills for some time now. CEOs 
and senior managers in large corporations have long recognised that 
the higher a person rises in an organisation, the more they are 
required to effectively employ in their job skills such as 
communication, leadership and team building and take full 
responsibility for the development of their firm’s business. That is 
why business leaders are taking advantage of soft skills training and 
enjoying significant returns. 
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The legal profession, by contrast, has only recently become aware of 
the importance of soft skills and the need to employ soft skills 
effectively, in a legal environment, when dealing with existing or 
potential clients and, within a firm, when dealing with superiors, 
colleagues, more junior lawyers, paralegals and other staff. 
 
The high-end section of the legal world appears to have now 
recognised that in order for a lawyer to be successful in their career 
(and profitable for their firm) they need to master and employ 
effectively both soft skills and technical skills. As a consequence, a 
number of the largest City firms now offer their lawyers and partners 
the opportunity to attend courses and programmes that provide basic 
training in soft skills.  
 
The breadth of these courses and programmes, however, still varies 
from firm to firm and only a few firms offer broad and all 
encompassing programs.  
 
2. The Importance of Soft Skills 
 
Some lawyers believe that they do not require any specific training in 
soft skills. They believe that, since they have become technically 
proficient in their area of expertise and are incredibly hard workers, 
they will be able to master soft skills with the same proficiency with 
which they are able to master their technical skills. Other lawyers 
believe that leadership and soft skills are qualities which by nature 
you either have or have not and that, if you are not born a leader or a 
great communicator, there is very little you can do to become one. 
 
All of these beliefs are wrong and unjustified. A lawyer who denies 
the importance of soft skills will generally experience difficulties and 
setbacks in their career. Typically, they will struggle to develop their 
business by winning new clients and new instructions or, within their 
firm, struggle to manage their team by retaining and motivating their 
assistants and support staff.  
 
How many times, for example, have you heard of a lawyer failing to 
secure instructions from a potential client because of a poor sales 
pitch despite the fact that they had the best credentials, capabilities 
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and technical skills? Perhaps something in the way the lawyer 
communicated with the potential client did not give the client the 
confidence they needed to instruct that lawyer with their business. 
Even though the client may have known that the lawyer was the 
most skilled to undertake the job, they offered the job to someone else 
who appeared to possess some “intangible qualities” that the first 
lawyer did not possess.  
 
Research suggests that only forty per cent. of a buying decision 
comes down to objective factors such as the suitability of the technical 
solution on offer and that the other sixty per cent. comes down to 
emotional factors such as the ability of the person pitching for the 
work to build personal rapport and trust with the buyer. Despite this, 
professionals, and especially lawyers, still believe that the best way to 
deliver a sales pitch is by pointing out their skills, capabilities and 
relevant experience rather than by trying to build a personal and 
special rapport with the potential client. 
 
Similarly, how many times have you heard of a lawyer who failed to 
deliver good quality advice in a transaction or case due to bad project 
management? Things would have gone differently had the relevant 
project been managed and organised effectively from the very 
beginning. 
 
Soft skills are also essential for every lawyer who wishes to become a 
partner in their firm. Often when existing partners consider an 
associate's potential for partnership, they will look at the associate's 
technical skills as well as their soft skills. The partners know that the 
associate can get the job done, but can they inspire others to do the 
same? The associate may have acquired excellent legal skills, but are 
they ready to take on all of the additional responsibilities that 
partnership gives such as generating and managing client 
relationships, supervising and training junior lawyers and handling 
firm management duties? 
 
While the particular mix of soft skills required may vary from one 
firm to another and, within the same firm, from one practice area to 
another, every lawyer practising law today require to employ 
effective soft skills in their job.  
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3. Soft Skills Training  
 
The aim of this book is to provide an introduction to the soft skills 
most relevant to the legal profession and explore certain related 
areas.  
 
Chapters 2 to 4 of this book deal with communication skills, namely 
non-verbal communication, verbal communication and business 
etiquette respectively. Among other things, these chapters introduce 
the concept of perception, a concept of utmost importance in 
communication, and look at the ways you can improve the 
perception others have of you by working on your image. 
 
Chapter 5 deals with career management and provides practical 
suggestions on how to become partner in a law firm. Chapter 6 deals 
with business development. It contains advice on the topics of 
marketing and sales pitches, two topics that are often frowned upon 
and treated with fear or scepticism by lawyers. The remaining 
chapters 7 to 9 deal with delegation and project management, public 
speaking and time and stress management respectively.  
 
This book does not purport to be a definitive guide on the topics 
covered but only to present the basic concepts and techniques that 
will enable you to employ soft skills more effectively in your work 
and, ultimately, help you become a better lawyer. If, after reading 
this book, you feel you may require further training in one or more of 
the areas covered, you may wish to seek additional specialised 
training by attending personal development seminars, management 
or business courses, or by contacting a professional coach. You may 
also wish to read some of the books, articles and publications that are 
listed in the bibliography and further reading section at the end of 
this book. 
 
From now on you should take advantage of any available 
professional development programme offered by your firm and must 
be proactive in filling any gaps left in your knowledge following such 
programme. Ask yourself what resources your firm offers and what 
activities it organises that could provide you with an opportunity to 
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develop the soft skills that you most require. From now on, soft skills 
should become an integral part of your training programme.  
 
Although your professional plate is probably more than full with the 
practice of law and business development activities, it is a wise 
investment of your time to also focus on soft skills development. 
Developing soft skills should not only be a matter of professional 
development but also (and foremost) a matter of personal 
development and self-improvement. This has a number of profound 
implications, some of which will be explored later.  
 
4. A Proactive Approach to Training 
 
If you wish to learn how to improve your soft skills, you have to take 
an active role in your learning process. You should identify by 
yourself the skills that you most need to develop and the specific 
activities that will help you develop those skills.  
 
If you are a junior lawyer and would like to refine your leadership 
skills, for example, you may want to volunteer to take on voluminous 
assignments, like a sizeable due diligence or disclosure exercise, 
which would require you to delegate tasks to a number of people and 
coordinate and supervise the work done by others. You may also 
want to let your supervisor know that you wish to practise your 
leadership skills so that they will be able to provide an opportunity 
as soon as one arises. If the opportunity does not arise, try to do some 
voluntary work. You may acquire strong leadership and organisation 
skills by becoming involved in a trade association or helping your 
favourite charity. 
 
If you are a slightly more senior lawyer and you wish to improve 
your public speaking skills, you may want to contribute to 
“introduction to practice” programs for more junior lawyers or 
trainees or deliver a presentation to your colleagues on a specific 
topic. These speaking opportunities will build your knowledge in the 
substantive areas concerned and expand your public speaking skills. 
They will also enhance your reputation and visibility within your 
firm which, as will be explained later, is crucial for career progression 
purposes. 
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If you are a newly appointed partner and would like to refine your 
business development skills, you may want to observe the partners in 
your firm who generate the most business and analyse the way they 
achieve that result. How do they market their services to the public at 
large? How do they make contacts with new clients? Which social or 
business networking events do they attend? Is their way to develop 
business different from the way you do it? Perhaps it may be time to 
emulate them and see if you generate the same results. Depending on 
your relationship with the partner in question, you could ask them to 
share their experience with you and give you some advice. Their 
support and feedback could be invaluable. 
 
To conclude, there are a number of areas on which you will have to 
actively work from today if you wish to become a better lawyer. 
Acquiring training in soft skills is a process that will require ongoing 
effort and commitment from you. However, if you believe that you 
can improve and have faith in yourself and your capabilities, you will 
be able to take on board the techniques and skills taught in this book 
and gradually incorporate them into your daily practice.  
 
You will then notice the difference these techniques and skills will 
make in your work and reap the rewards of all your efforts. You will 
notice that working will be easier and soon you will become more 
confident and more in control of your work.  Remember, if you can 
get your soft skills right, you will be ahead of your colleagues and 
competitors, and up to the task in any situation.   




